
Bremen International Graduate School of Social Sciences                   Spring 2024 

 

BIGSSS Colloquium at Constructor University 

 

Tuesday, 14:00-15:30 (exceptions marked in yellow) 

In person: Constructor University, South Hall, Seminar Room West 

 
Coordinator: Dr. Franziska Deutsch; fdeutsch@bigsss-bremen.de  
 
 

Date Presenter Topic Remark 

Friday, 
15.03.2024, 

9:15-10:45 

Tanya Keni 

Honor, dignity and 
migration:  

Navigating cultural norms 
and threat responses 

among Native Indians, 
Germans, and Indian 
migrants in Germany 

RTG Doctoral Researcher 

PhD Supervisors: 

Prof. Dr. Ulrich Kühnen 
Dr. Mandy Boehnke 

19.03.2024 Dr. Dora Simunovic 

Common resource 
management in 

heterogeneous groups:  

Where to next 

Affiliated Postdoc BIGSSS /  

Postdoctoral Researcher 
Constructor University 

02.04.2024 Gamze Ipek 

You are free to choose your 
struggle:  

Exploring the mediating 
role of work-family 

interference in the complex 
dynamics of life goals and 

well-being 

RTG Doctoral Researcher 

PhD Supervisors: 

Prof. Dr. Sonia Lippke 
Prof. Sonja Drobnič, PhD 

09.04.2024 Carina Hartz 

Perceptions of social 
cohesion:  

Visegrad countries and 
Germany compared  

RTG Doctoral Researcher 

PhD Supervisors: 

Prof. Dr. Klaus Boehnke 
Dr. Franziska Deutsch 

16.04.2024 Pay Laurin Jessen 

The Morality as 
Cooperation—Deviance 
Relevance Scale (MaC—

DRS):  

Results from two studies 
conducted in Germany 

RTG Doctoral Researcher 

PhD Supervisors: 

Prof. Dr. Johannes Huinink 
Prof. Dr. Ulrich Kühnen 

Monday,  

22.04.2024 

9:45-12:30 

Franziska Deutsch, 
Ulrich Kühnen, Regina 
Arant, Sabine Sommer 

How to defend your 
dissertation 

Transferable Skills 
Workshop:  

Attendance is optional 

mailto:fdeutsch@bigsss-bremen.de
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Date Presenter Topic Remark 

23.04.2024 - - - 

30.04.2024 Katharina Schiffer 

Bandura's social learning 
theory and the concept of 
self-efficacy in the context 

of healthcare professionals' 
experience for effective 

work interaction and 
consequent improvement 

of mental health 

PhD Proposal Defense 

RTG Doctoral Researcher 

PhD Supervisors: 

Prof. Dr. Sonia Lippke 
Prof. Dr. Jan Lorenz 

07.05.2024 Dariya Koleva 

Digital resistance 
communities:  

A qualitative investigation 
of solidarity and social 

identity online 

RTG Doctoral Researcher 

PhD Supervisors: 

Dr. Franziska Deutsch 
Prof. Dr. Jan Lorenz 

14.05.2024 Dr. Adekunle Adedeji 

Perceived 
microaggressions and 

quality of life:  

The mediating role of 
personal resources and 
social support among 
people with African 

migration background in 
Germany 

Affiliated Postdoc BIGSSS / 

 Adjunct Researcher at 
Constructor University / 

 Young Akademie Fellow at 
the Akademie der 

Wissenschaften in Hamburg 

 
RTG: Research Training Group “Social Dynamics of the Self” 


